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CROSSWORD PUZZLE
Complete the crossword using words from this week’s parsha.
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Down

1. The hard ______ were brought to 
Mosheh, but the small _______ were 
brought to the rulers.

3. Mosheh, Aharon and _______ went up 
to the top of the mountain.

4. Who prevailed when Mosheh's hands 
were up?

5. Yahweh's hand is against Amaleq from 
_________ to ___________.

9. Who was Mosheh's youngest son?

Across

2. His hands were ________ until the 
going down of the sun.

4. Who was Mosheh's father-in-law?

5. Who was Mosheh's oldest son?

6. Mosheh chose _______ men to rightly 
rule.

7. Who was Mosheh's wife?

8. Amaleq came and fought with Yisra'el in 
____________.

10. What did they put under Mosheh's 
hands when they became heavy?
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Answer Key
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Down

1. The hard matters were brought to 
Mosheh, but the small matters were 
brought to the rulers.

3. Mosheh, Aharon and Hur went up to the 
top of the mountain.

4. Who prevailed when Mosheh's hands 
were up? Yisra'el

5. Yahweh's hand is against Amaleq from 
generation to generation.

9. Who was Mosheh's youngest son? 
Eli'ezer

Across

2. His hands were steady until the going 
down of the sun.

4. Who was Mosheh's father-in-law? Yitro

5. Who was Mosheh's oldest son? 
Gereshom

6. Mosheh chose able men to rightly rule.

7. Who was Mosheh's wife? Tsipporah

8. Amaleq came and fought with Yisra'el in 
Rephidim.

10. What did they put under Mosheh's 
hands when they became heavy? stone


